T WETAE@R &1 FEWd (FEn @ 256),
AFY T, $TETE - 500 004.

OFFICE OF THE PRINCIPAL ACCOUNTANT GENERAL (A&E),
ANDHRA PRADESH HYDERABAD - 500 004.

ﬁ?i?H/Date:

The Director of Treasuries and Accounts
Hyderabad

Sir,

Sub:- Forwarding of Accountant General (A&E) Chattisgarh SSA NO PA/revn. Of
pension/MLA/831 Dt.07-07-2011

Ref:- 1.Govt. of Chattisgarh GO number166 Dt.06.05.2011-Vidhan Sabha Sadasya
Vetan

I am herewith enclosing a Special Seal Authority issued by the Principal
Accountant General (A&E) , Chattisgarh in the reference cited. The same is being placed

in this office official website (www.ag.ap.nic.in). You are requested to direct all the

District Treasury Officers to download the orders and take necessary action at the earliest

to minimize hardship to the pensioners.

/ N

Yours ’ﬁp/l’itl}féily,

/ /%\'\/\/"\

Sr Accq%mts Officer
J

Copy To
Joint Director, Pension Payment Office,
Nampally, Hyderabad for information and necessary action.

Sr Accounts Officer

oo/ Phone : 040-23236810-19, s‘-ﬁa / E-mail : agaeAndhrapradesh@cag.gov.in
Web Site : http://ag.ap.nic.in e / Fax : 040-23232441 d¥ / Grams : Accounts




Bod TG, TAYR

A ot/ MLA

\

5
HETAWIHIR (A&l Ud gdhar) BINTTY

qerycar gael.
N Y N oS, aysogEnG - o e

- Boarsg - Sococos
\a A\‘\ fawa—wcldine wog & arig gd e wewdl & Weifda 8 8 dee @

fAereor grdq |
evt-oalie [y qayr & Uz wHid 6930 /{33 /ddl. /U 9611 /2011
fa-ie 17.06.2011

HEIGY,
%Q & SWRIdd favuraifa vallrg ISus $iieb-166 fQ-Td 6 W 2011 W YIS
Q,> well g RUFRM Haw dd- e ar dere (dener) sffafyay 2011 & wramwfa
/ Aol & & HJUR Baiiie vy & Matad a2 § Paifaa Ny yd aeal o

ger, fafbedn s, qerd U fadie 6 78 2011 9 fP1UR 29 B |

1. 999 Af¥1 WYY 10,000 & R4 Y ¥ WU 16,000 / —~YHT. B
¥ |

2. fafecar wcar -~ Afd wud 1,500 & I oR AR wWYd 25,00 /-UHL B <) A

3. eH Uer T — V¥ WYY 5000 & W UR VA WYY 8,000 / ~UHLH € A

SURIGATUR FENEA bR T BT gAf¥aa & |

RECIRRICEANPA IR
gfaferfy:
1. Iuafad wefRiTe faurrmr afaray IayR &1 3R ga-rel ufded |

& lann—
RECIRCICCARIPA'IAY

\S/\ $ld /WY /Y1 42T/ gagas./, QR ) fese O?f\:H\%"



“FUETe/571/09/2010-2012.”

I ¥ T e (e
fewe) ¥ J9T 2 SAAG. FHHIE
S, 2-22-sorgTg Tee/38 TR, A
Ty, faqiw 30-5-2001.

( STETEIT )
TR § YehiivTd

S 166 | ; W, W,ﬁ?f‘m"éuézon——_éwam,wwss

fofr iR faredt e farsam

UUR, T 7 A/ 2011

T 3336/113/21-F/FL/B. T./11. — SO TaM T 1 FreAfeiniaa Srufes fog R f% 03-05-2011 =
TETE HI A K B GH ¢, TISER HAHYRY 1 SHER & o v frar s 2.

BEHIEIE % TSTAIA & A § T SR,
. TS AN, ifaiea 9fea.

331




332

(FERF 12 9 2011)

ERTE e T wewm S, s Fu G (Heit)

3|, 2011

WA (U™ U T2 e, 91 /9 Uvr SRfTan, 1972 (F9% 7 991973 )

w1 T HYTiHE 3 e el :

ST 6% T EVIRA. 2,

HRT 6- WIEVIEE. 3.

I R

URA TR ¥ Aeed oY ¥ wereng fa wvew g freteies w9 § 98 sttt

(1) = SfutEs oo faum 99 5o 969, S o Yvm (SEeE) futes,
2011 FEAT.

(2) | =% U9 ¥ 9% TEUE F] AE § 359 3

BURG 99T T wee 3o, W1 7 U9 Sfufags, 1972 (s 7 §11972) (S 5l

T A S T Y FRE ) 3 9% 6w = sTm (1) # v e e
F H R VR “Hiele g9 weeentie 5 5.

T a5 9R -1 H W U TR F TYF WO “HE T iqeiia A

Eict

m@mme-wnw WWWW’EFQTHWW g FIR 9" |/

TR, feqres 7 5% 2011

~

FHE 3336/113/21-3/FL/B. /11— 9 & WA % 370 348 F T0E (3) F wEw d s faum
T HEE Fad, W ae See (rmr%ﬁ’) A, 2011 (A 12 w21 W SIS SR T % MR §

TGN FHIe fa S €.

BEETE % TS99 F A9 ¥ 79 FARATIR,
. T TRareht, Al giea.




¢ . werTe U9, T 6 w8 2011

332 (1)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 12 of 2011)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA
' TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2011

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1373).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic
of India, as follows :—

1. {1 This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Ofticial Gazette.

(3]

In sub-section (1) of Section 6-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan,
Bhatta Tatha Pensicn Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), (hereinafter referred to as the
Principal Act) for the words “Ten Thousand” the words “Sixteen Thousand” shall be
substituted.

(93

In Section 6-B of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand” the words “Eight
Thousand” shall be substituted.

e

In Section 6-C of the Principal Act, for the words “One thousand five hundred” the
words “Two Thousand Five Hundred” shall be substituted.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Section 6-A.

Amendment of
Section 6-B.

Amendment of -

Section 6-C.

TR, 50 AU TREH W ST BRI VTS & gRuTerd, TSI ¥ HiEE qe wEie— 2011,




